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Item 3.01. Notice of Delisting or Failure to Satisfy a Continued Listing Rule or Standard; Transfer of Listing.
 
On June 24, 2019, JAKKS Pacific, Inc. (the “Company”) received written notice from the Listing Qualifications Staff of The NASDAQ Stock Market LLC
(“NASDAQ”) notifying the Company that its common shares, no par value, closed below the $1.00 per share minimum bid price required by NASDAQ
Listing Rule 5450(a)(1) for 30 consecutive business days. NASDAQ’s notice has no immediate effect on the listing or trading of the Company’s common
shares, which will continue to trade on NASDAQ under the symbol “JAKK”.
 
In accordance with NASDAQ Listing Rule 5810(c)(3)(A), the Company has an automatic period of 180 calendar days, or until December 23, 2019, and may
be eligible for additional time, to achieve compliance with the minimum bid price requirement. The Company will regain compliance with the minimum bid
price requirement if at any time before December 23, 2019, the bid price for the Company’s common shares closes at $1.00 per share or above for a minimum
of 10 consecutive business days. The Company can also seek stockholder approval of a reverse stock split, which would have to be completed by December
6, 2019 in order to regain compliance, but there can be no assurance that a reverse stock split would be approved by stockholders and implemented by that
date.
 
As previously described in the Current Report on Form 8-K dated February 26, 2019 and the Current Report on Form 8-K dated May 9, 2019, the Special
Committee of the Company’s Board of Directors (the “Special Committee”) engaged in discussions and negotiations with Hong Kong Meisheng Cultural
Company Limited (“Meisheng”), regarding a purchase by Meisheng of sufficient newly issued shares of the Company’s common stock such that Meisheng
would own 51% of the Company’s outstanding shares, and with Oasis Investments II Master Fund Ltd. (“Oasis”) and an ad hoc group of holders (the “Ad
Hoc Group”) of the 4.875% convertible senior notes due 2020 (the “2020 Notes”) issued by the Company concerning, among other things, the Meisheng
proposal and extension of maturities of the Company’s convertible senior notes. The Company is still awaiting notification from Meisheng regarding the
status of certain approvals needed to advance the aforementioned transactions, including approvals from Chinese regulatory bodies. As a result, no executed
and binding agreements related to these transactions (including any commitment letter, term sheet, or similar agreement) have been reached with Meisheng,
any member of the Ad Hoc Group, any other holders of the 2020 Notes or Oasis regarding the Meisheng transaction.
 
As previously announced in the Current Report on Form 8-K dated May 9, 2019, the Company reached an agreement in principle with the Ad Hoc Group and
Oasis with respect to an alternative transaction, in lieu of the Meisheng proposal, that contemplates the extension or refinancing of the Credit Agreement and
other ancillary documents and agreements with Wells Fargo, retirement of the Term Loan with GACP Finance Co., LLC, the retirement or refinancing of the
Term Loan, and the provision of incremental liquidity to the Company, and the amendment and extension of the Company’s convertible senior notes due 2020
issued to Oasis. The alternative transaction contemplates an investment by holders of the 2020 Notes to exchange into a new secured debt instrument, plus the
issuance of significant equity, including preferred equity, to exchanging holders. The foregoing is only a summary of the alternative transaction proposal and
is not intended to be a complete description of all of the terms and conditions thereof, including the potential significant dilution that could occur as a result of
the issuance of new equity contemplated by the alternative transaction and changes to the composition of the independent members of the Company’s Board
of Directors. The Company and the Ad Hoc Group are continuing to negotiate definitive documentation for an alternative transaction, but no executed and
binding agreements (including any commitment letter, term sheet, or similar agreement) have been reached with Wells Fargo or any other lender, any member
of the Ad Hoc Group, any other holder of the 2020 Notes, or Oasis.
 

 



 

 
As a result of the delays in concluding the Meisheng transaction and the alternative transaction with the Ad Hoc Group, and as announced in the Quarterly
Report on Form 10-Q dated May 9, 2019, the Company has continued to explore alternative transactions with the support of Jefferies LLC. As a result of such
efforts, the Company recently received a confidential non-binding expression of interest to acquire all of the shares of the Company for an indicated price of
$.80 per share on a fully diluted basis. The Company and its advisors have engaged in discussions with the interested party regarding the non-binding
proposal and have commenced furnishing information to such party in connection with due diligence activities. Such discussions are still in their early stages
and no agreements or understandings have been reached with respect to such proposal and such indicated price may also change in a final offer, if made.
 
The Company is continuing to pursue all of the foregoing alternative transactions. No assurance can be given that the ongoing discussions and negotiations
will result in a consummation of a transaction with any of the parties identified above, or with any other party, and that even if a transaction is consummated
that its final terms will resemble the terms described above.
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